
THE PROTECTION OF HUMAN RIGHTS (AMENDMENT)

 ACT, 2019

NO. 19 OF  2019

[27th  July, 2019.]

An Act further to amend the Protection of Human Rights Act, 1993.

BE it enacted by Parliament in the Seventieth Year of the Republic of India as follows:—

1. (1) This Act may be called the Protection of Human Rights (Amendment) Act, 2019.

(2) It shall come into force on such date as the Central Government may, by notification

in the Official Gazette, appoint.

2. In the Protection of Human Rights Act, 1993 (hereinafter referred to as the principal

Act), in section 2, in sub-section (1),––

(i) after clause (b), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—

‘(ba) “Chief Commissioner” means the Chief Commissioner for Persons

with Disabilities referred to in sub-section (1) of section 74 of the Rights of

Persons with Disabilities Act, 2016;’;

(ii) after clause (g), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—

‘(ga) “National Commission for Backward Classes” means the National

Commission for Backward Classes constituted under section 3 of the National

Commission for Backward Classes Act, 1993;’;

Short title and

commencement.

Amendment

of section 2.

10 of 1994.

49 of 2016.

27 of 1993.

jftLVªh lañ Mhñ ,yñ—(,u)04@0007@2003—19

vlk/kkj.k
EXTRAORDINARY

Hkkx  II — [k.M 1

PART II — Section 1

izkf/kdkj ls izdkf'kr
PUBLISHED  BY  AUTHORITY

lañ   38] ubZ fnYyh] 'kfuokj] tqykbZ 27] 2019@Jko.k 5] 1941 ¼'kd½
No. 38]  NEW DELHI, SATURDAY, JULY 27, 2019/SHRAVANA 5, 1941 (SAKA)

bl Hkkx esa fHkUu i`"B la[;k nh tkrh gS ftlls fd ;g vyx ladyu ds :i esa j[kk tk ldsA
Separate paging is given to this Part in order that it may be filed as a separate compilation.

REGISTERED NO. DL—(N)04/0007/2003—19

MINISTRY OF LAW AND JUSTICE

(Legislative Department)

New Delhi, the 27th July, 2019/Shravana 5, 1941  (Saka)

The following Act of Parliament received the assent of the President on the

27th July, 2019, and is hereby published for general information:—



2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—

(iii) after clause (h), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—

‘(ha) “National Commission for Protection of Child Rights” means the

National Commission for Protection of Child Rights constituted under section 3

of the Commissions for Protection of Child Rights Act, 2005;’.

3. In section 3 of the principal Act,—

(a) in sub-section (2),—

(i)  in clause (a), for the words “Chief Justice”, the words “Chief Justice of

India or a Judge” shall be substituted;

(ii)  in clause (d), for the words “two Members”, the words “three Members,

out of which at least one shall be a woman,” shall be substituted;

(b)  in sub-section (3),—

(i) for the words “the National Commission for Minorities”, the words

“, the National Commission for Backward Classes, the National Commission for

Minorities, the National Commission for Protection of Child Rights” shall be

substituted;

(ii) for the words “and the National Commission for Women”, the words

“the National Commission for Women and the Chief Commissioner for Persons

with Disabilities” shall be substituted;

(c) in sub-section (4), for the portion beginning with “shall exercise such powers

and discharge such functions” and ending with “as the case may be”, the following

shall be substituted, namely:—

“shall, subject to control of the Chairperson, exercise all administrative

and financial powers (except judicial functions and the power to make regulations

under section 40B).”.

4. In section 6 of the principal Act,—

(i) in sub-section (1),—

(a) for the words “five years”, the words “three years” shall be substituted;

(b) after the words “whichever is earlier” occurring at the end, the words

“and shall be eligible for re-appointment” shall be inserted;

(ii) in sub-section (2),—

(a) for the words “five years”, the words “three years” shall be substituted;

(b) the words “for another term of five years” shall be omitted.

5. In section 21 of the principal Act,—

(i) in sub-section (2), in clause (a), for the words “Chief Justice”, the words

“Chief Justice or a Judge” shall be substituted;

(ii) in sub-section (3), for the words “shall exercise such powers and discharge

such functions of the State Commission as it may delegate to him”, the words “shall,

subject to control of the Chairperson, exercise all administrative and financial powers

of the State Commission” shall be substituted;

(iii) after sub-section (6), the following sub-sections shall be inserted, namely:—

“(7) Subject to the provisions of section 12, the Central Government may,

by order, confer upon the State Commission the functions relating to human

rights being discharged by the Union territories, other than the Union territory

of  Delhi.

4 of 2006.

Amendment

of section 6.

Amendment

of section 3.

Amendment

of section 21.



SEC. 1] THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY 3

(8) The functions relating to human rights in case of Union territory of

Delhi shall be dealt with by the Commission.”.

6. In section 24 of the principal Act,—

(i) in sub-section (1),—

(a) for the words “five years”, the words “three years” shall be substituted;

(b) after the words “whichever is earlier” occurring at the end, the words

“and shall be eligible for re-appointment” shall be inserted;

(ii) in sub-section (2),––

(a) for the words “five years”, the words “three years” shall be substituted;

(b) the words “for another term of five years” occurring at the end, shall

be omitted.

————

DR. REETA VASISHTA,

Additional Secretary to the Govt. of  India.

Amendment

of section 24.

MGIPMRND—2154GI(S3)—27-07-2019.

UPLOADED BY THE MANAGER, GOVERNMENT OF INDIA PRESS, MINTO ROAD,  NEW DELHI–110002

AND PUBLISHED BY THE CONTROLLER OF PUBLICATIONS, DELHI–110054.


		2019-07-27T17:06:18+0530
	BANSHI DHAR DUBEY




